SrariiE ’@

BRTITON [FLIXCTH
C)?)’ew O BE)B

5oR — P BOTURT, WONFT, 0%, BERLWTT, 5090 (83w, V4, ITIHF, OEVA) 30. SO
Part — IVA BENGALURU, TUESDAY, 05, OCTOBER, 2021(ASHWAYUJA, 13, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943) No. 814

DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT
NOTIFICATION
NO: DPAL 38 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED:05.10.2021

The Karnataka Police (Amendment) Bill, 2021 9%, 20210 980,£20° 30N%
438 DVOTLOD T%sz00DT Wi WRTIE), Aeos IFRBPIMNON B,
20218 TOoFET PO ROBs: 28 D0WITIN DD0T: 05.10.2021F006 3T
Do2sB I3 IR TosBYT (207 IVA) 0D, IFE3RCTOR) e3t3edR N,

KARNATAKA ACT NO.28 OF 2021

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 5t Day of
October 2021)

THE KARNATAKA POLICE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2021
(Received the assent of the Governor on the 4th day of October, 2021)

An Act further to amend the Karnataka Police Act, 1963.

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Police Act, 1963
(Karnataka Act 4 of 1964), for the purpose hereinafter appearing:

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy second year
of the Republic of India as follows:-

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the
Karnataka Police (Amendment) Act, 2021.

(2) It shall come into force at once.

2. Amendment of Section 2.-In section 2 of the Karnataka Police Act, 1963

(Karnataka Act 04 of 1964) (here in after referred to as the Principal Act) in clause
(3)7'

@)



)

(a) after the words “Profit or gain” occurring in two places the words “or
otherwise” shall be inserted.
(b) in clause (7),

(i) for the words "gaming" does not include a lottery but includes all
forms of wagering or betting in connection with any game of chance
except wagering or betting on a horse-race run on any race course
within or outside the State, when such wagering or betting takes
place" the words "gaming means and includes online games,
involving all forms of wagering or betting, including in the form of
tokens valued in terms of money paid before or after issue of it, or
electronic means and virtual currency, electronic transfer of funds
in connection with any game of chance, but does not include a
lottery or wagering or betting on horse-race run on any race course
within or outside the State, when such wagering or betting takes
place” shall be substituted.

(ii) in the explanation in item (i) the following shall be inserted at the
end, namely:-

"any act or risking money, or otherwise on the unknown result of an
event including on a game of skill and any action specified above
carried out directly or indirectly by the players playing any game or
by any third parties".

(c) for clause (11) the following shall be substituted, namely:-

"(11) 'Instruments of gaming' includes any article used or intended to be
used as a subject or means of gaming, including computers, computer
system, mobile app or internet or cyber space, virtual platform, computer
network, computer resource, any communication device, electronic
applications, software and accessory or means of online gaming, any
document, register or record or evidence of any gaming in electronic or
digital form, the proceeds of any online gaming as or any winning or prizes
in money or otherwise distributed or intended to be distrubted inrespect
of any gaming;

Explanation: The words ‘computer’, ‘communication device’, ‘computer

network’, ‘computer resource’, ‘computer system’, ‘cyber café’ and ‘electronic

record’ used in this Act shall have the respective meaning assigned to them
in the Information Technology Act, 2000 (Central Act 21 of 2000)".

(d) after clause (12) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(12A) “Online gaming” means and includes games as defined in
clause (7) played online by means of instruments of gaming,
computer, computer resource, computer net work, computer system



&

or by mobile app or internet or any communication device, electronic
application, software or on any virtual platform;"

(e) In clause (13), the following shall be inserted at the end, namely:-

"including a recreation club or on virtual platform, mobile app or
internet or any communication device, electronic application,
software, online gaming and computer resource as defined in
Information Technology Act, 2000(Central Act 21 of 2000) or under
this Act;"

3. Amendment of Section 78.-In section 78 of the Principal Act, In sub-
section (1) in clause (a),-

(a) after the words "enclosure, vehicle, vessel or place" the words and
figures "or at cyber café or online gaming involving wagering or betting
including computer resource or mobile application or internet or any
communication device as defined in the Information Technology Act,
2000 (Central Act 21 of 2000)" shall be inserted.

(i) in clause (vi) after the words "depend on chance or" the words "skill of
other" shall be inserted.
(ii) after the clause (vi) the following shall be inserted, namely:-

"(vijon any act on risking money or otherwise on the
unknown result of an event including on a game of skill";
or

(ii)  in the hanging para for the words "one year" the words "three years"

and for the words "one thousand" the words "one lakh" shall be
substituted.

(iv) in the proviso for the words “one month” the words “six months” and
for the words “five hundred” the words “ten thousand” shall
respectively be substituted;

(b) In sub-section (2),-

(i) after the words "sub section or present" the words "or aids or abets"
shall be inserted;

(ii) for the words "one month" the words "six months" and for the words
"five hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be respectively
substituted;

(c) In sub-section (3), for the words "three months" the words "one year" and
for the words "three hundred" the words "twenty thousand" shall be
respectively substituted.

4. Amendment of Section 79.- In section 79 of the Principal Act,-

(i) in the hanging para, for the words "one year" the words "three years" shall
be substituted and after the word "fine" the words "up to rupees one lakh" shall be
inserted;



(ii) in the proviso,-
(a) in clause (a) for the words "three months" the words "six months"
and for the words "five hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be
respectively substituted,;

(b) in clause (b) for the words "six months" the words "one year" and for
the words "five hundred" the words "fifteen thousand" shall be
respectively substituted; and

(¢) in clause (c) for the words "nine months" the words "eighteen
months" and for the words "one thousand" the words "twenty
thousand" shall be respectively substituted.

5. Amendment of Section 80.-In section 80 of the Principal Act,-

(i) for the words "one year" the words "three years" shall be substituted and
after the word "fine" the words "upto rupees one lakh" shall be inserted;

(ii) in the proviso,-
(a) in clause (a) for the words "one month" the words "six months" and

for the words "two hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be
respectively substituted;

(b) in clause (b) for the words "three months" the words "one year" and
for the words "two hundred" the words "fifteen thousand" shall be
respectively substituted; and

(c) in clause (c) for the words "six months" the words "eighteen months"
and for the words "five hundred" the words "twenty thousand" shall
be respectively substituted.

6. Amendment of Section 87.-In section 87 of the Principal Act,-

(a) after the words "suspected to be gaming" the words "or aiding or
abetting such gaming" shall be inserted;

(b) for the words "three months" the words "six months" and for the words
"three hundred" the words "Ten thousand" shall be respectively
substituted.

7. Amendment of Section 114.- In section 114 of the Principal Act, after
the words “fine” the words “which shall not be less than twenty five thousand but
which may extend to rupees one lakh” shall be inserted.

8. Insertion of section 128A.-After section 128 the Principal Act the
following shall be inserted, namely:-

“128A.Certain offences to be Cognizable, Non-bailable,-

(1) All offences under chapter VII except section 87; and all offences
under section 90, 108, 113, 114 and 123 under chapter VIII shall be
cognizable and non-bailable;

(2) Offences under section 87 shall be cognizable and bailable .”



3

9. Amendment of section 176.-In section 176 of the Principal Act, the words “and
to wagering by persons taking part in such game of skill” shall be omitted.

By Order and in the name of
the Governor of Karnataka,

G.SRIDHAR
Secretary to Government
Department of Parliamentary
Affairs and Legislation

RORTDCOD F;[HeONRY) DI, FAN BW 230D
DI P WS
Ro83;: IO Ty 38 FoIS 2021, 230N ¥RV, DT0F: 05.10.2021.
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) G

RTTED 5-d T BODE), Tos000D0T e9PTF,INRPAIT The Karnataka Police
(Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act No 28 of 2021) 3 208003030, &99T3
T, BF5e30030  DV00T: 05.10.2021 TUEEIT Do%5883)T3 )FR Dossad T (0N -
IVA) 00, &3TE3R23eT 0T e33R IINT.

2021 O F0oF &% 9D Joals: 28
(2021 3B 9B LV0° 30NE 53 DIJV0TTOR) ToEEdT U5 IR

R0WBTODE), BRTEN ByTEONT)

FooFEdT PO (3T RID) 9BDDoDHD, 2021
(2021 B e98R,£200° 30NF 43¢ DVOTWOT) Tos doODOT 2ued IO,
RBOHINT)

Fooe&T FPEOCERD RN, 196330, NI R, ST HE VB 2,0T
(STAINIOWIN S

Q). B2,E0T FORY 2TV VB LSNPMON T EdT FREERY LRI,
196330, (19648 TOF&LT PRI 4) D3R, VBB 00BITHT
ONT 2 NBIH)TBOOTT;

BT, OTC3 TNER0%E DR,SIOBI RVRERC), Foe&dT Tos PO
SDOBOTWROT T3 V0RNTOIZ LIP3 E);-

1. 803 B, BRI DI, TYT023.- (1) B LIPIONTNIN, TREET FREOCAD
(BTN LRI, 2021 OT) TTODNIT, ...



&

(2) AT, S8 TRTWSE BN 2WTIT,,,;

2.2:3¢ RVyTOOT 3T BR.- Toor&dT FPOCR L9 19633 (19643
FOOEET IDNAONTD 04)  (YW3E). ¥INN0T DR 9IRDDONTIOTI)
V3 LNFEINT) 23 &WyTTT (3)3€ VOB, -

(D) ATV FRNFSD). T @023 IFT0 FOTWOWN" 0 RWNY 3323000
€930 LT D0 WHNFD, ADRIT,T,..

() 73 DOBBE),-

(i) "2 RTEY" GREDODR, WwPFNRPF)N). S3TT Tozsts WP 95300 BTN
O350)T BLA® FRLAIEIC). BTNT LT WOTT a3 2023 FEILe)T 9T edo
BETEI)TONRY, BRTIDTEA, OT 2023 TI),edT I BEITEI,IT O
SBRNWINS  2RWIET YT RBOT;W  ROWOFTRAS D), DI
20V TEIN,IT BITRY BEITEINITONT), WFNRRF)T" D00 BVWNY WBN
"RRTEY" DOTT e3°¢3,0° e3E3N ) TONW E3RETRNY BRBTA.L),, BB, RT3
RRTION) e9T3200 3300 T/ T3 IAIE DWOBINFE) 2P BRODTITH) T,
WFNRBROT LITWISVOS ITEPNED eI, WUWE WL FTVA),, DPNE TS0 3NOE 353,
RNOY, DCIOD 230 TINEIT I BEITELITONT), WPNRRFPE)T), ST
REDONT, I TS WP €900 BRTN TLA® FRCAEFIC). TWIT T
WOTSEW RS ©OF  20RTENIT BP0 RBOTEEITON)  SBONWINS
BOTWsTEe)T OFRO  BEITEITONT), WFNRAPDND." D0V BVWNP,
B33 RCBRITLR,,.

(i) dTBTBOD 2302 (i) B, "9 BOWBT" DO0W JBRNY 33w &3
EODITTI, ADRIT,T,, DOWT:-

"O3002) T BEDTON) RO LITe0 OI0eYTE TOONE LITeI0 LT TOT T3
BOW5BIPRROTB BFODIT0T NPT RO TN O30e)TE BWOTI5e300,T3de
e383MRCT) 90 OB NPT WFTTT) J3LTed0N 9500 BORLTI0N
FHRRPES, 2003 ADERBLFIEAT 00T TOODE" D02 BWNPD, ADAITLE,..

(2) (11 DOTBT, B8 &DI0DIT, &B)3BRCRA ST, DOTIT:-



a

"(11) 'R TITIIT O CVIWTTLIND' Q0 BVL3e) NET ODOIZNED, NEdT ODOI)
BB (ARL0), B €355° 9900 I0IZWIED T AW O® T, a3LDEI®
T, N ODOF) W, NEITON0T; AOBSAL, P AORBS AR,
TSNS BIT,ONNTINY), 30IYOINFIRPRPOWO3 BRWITBITOD 23R,a00N
9P AOPSNFON WFAE 900 WFROD) VB LIAT OD0e)TE 3R, a03,
O30T ZBRTOTWILITOD NTAIESINY) IR0 AORSND), dT500N T30
G233y SRJTA.RE O0HTC  2RITIITORN O0eHTC TR, 0BX,O°
eIT0 €92IE3CD IFed0 ARFs ITe00 BOWEN VW LIRCT 00eYTE IOLINPD
eI BT TRBTW T B T 23T BRBTWD.B0 WINPT,
WENRRY),ST.

DWOB:- 58 RINDTE). WPRET  "MedFTON0I)" 'RBORT/S  AOGS'
NEITON0T) W, NMEDTON0T) ROTVSLL', NEdTONO0T) BB (AARL0), ' Ayg0°® T&'
2D, )TV NS B8 BWNYD, w3008 03[9, 9PICHD,  20003¢)
(20008 FEOTY) RDNIACAND 21) PN 9NTeDeN BT ITEeS,L
BRODTIT,R,."

(8d) (12)3€ DOTWTI 3TI0 &3 ZN0DITW, ADABTLE, DOTT:-

“(120) "€30° e30° WRWRTWIIT” NOWT (7). DOBRTE). TDLIRAITI0S,
2RTORBIITOD CVBTTLNY AOFINY 3DROT 30°eH"S). 30303 BWOTSTYD
NI, YT NEITON0I), NEITONOIF) A0TSR, NEITON0I) FAONE L, NEITONOI,
BB (AARL0) 9T 33T €3e0° DROT €900 I0IWRED I O3I0e) T
RORJ/S TS, )TN €93,00T, S0IYOTTW  aNRDT 95300 O30 TIC
BWRE RO SDTONED), 3TV BWOWNP Y, WP, 3.

() (13)3¢ VOBT "0WITW3E)." D0 BVWE IT02000N B8 20T T,
~AORIT,R,, NOTWT:-

"B 30308 RIODD, 20003€). (20008 FCOW, PO 21)
BOLOAATOZ  DITORD FLF 90 a3LPECF LDFTONE), 30233 e31°
95300 €903 VEER LITI0 OV TE ROBBS AOGS, TN EIS,0NT, 30IYOT,
30} BRTITBIIT a0, NEITONO0I) A0TSR, WwPNPOTBOI



9

3. 78:3¢ ®T0TW SWIJ/B;- DR IPIADINT 783¢ JyF3TT (1)3C
VBT TS () DOWBTE),,-

(Q) " 383060, 0B, NOT ITe AFR" N0W JWNY 3TV “e953=00
RPdd 303, S 9PO,20003), (20003 FEOW) PR 21)
BOLORATIO3 NEDTONOT) ROTDLL CITI0 a323360° &I 0T 95300 0T ED
OB OO AOWJ/NS ARPETR), WFNPOTB ADT° J00 90 VO3
T, T T WD TED )T, WwFNRRORTIE e50°e3;0° 2UPTRRBIIT” O
BWNF[), 3N, OBNP I, ADRIT,T,.

(i) (V)€ DOTWTE). "eITIyR 2330y D02 VT ZTI20ON “eITIa00 30 30.2,,3
FOF5e330," RO WEeII), ADRIT,R),.

(i) (Vi) DOBTS 3B2a3003 B8 sNV0RITWI), ALDA BTN, DOTIT:-

"(vii) BBEITON) ROIEIT O30T TOONE €TI0 LITsHO TOT D5 BWOTI5a3:3,
WPNPROB FDI0T NI )T TJRONT aNee3; e9z3e0”

(iii) 9B BRCRI DORTONE). 20T WIIREWTNR" D0 IWNRY BTN
"RV BRENMFRTNR” 02 BWNRF S, TN 20T AIT” 02 BWNY WBN
"200T3) OF" D0 VWNF, 3B RERAIT,T),.

(iv) BB0ITEE). 2003 SONPR" 02 BWNY WTWeIN "e33) 3ONPR" 0
BENF D, 203, "80T3) SRTY" 02 VWNY 0TWN "B, AOe)T" D0 BWNP,
930TjeNN &pS3O3RCBAST,T),;

() (2 BVI) TR, -

(i) "e9¢) TWwDTWT" D0W BWNY 3TV €900 ~30ey) RT3 90
TR, LDRATT" D0 BBNFID, ADRIT,,;

(i) "200T) 3ONPTTNR" 02 BWNRY WTIN "33 3ONPITNR" 20
BERNF T, 2NID, “B0TISTRT" 020 BWNY WWN "3, AeedT” D0 BWNFY,
90T e00N B33 R IT,,;

() 3)3C NVIVTFTTIWRE). "eDRTY SONFINFR[TNR” D0 BWNY TN

"20003) WRETWRTNR” 2D, "eDRTBI SRTY” D0 BWNY TN "QYed,3), XoedT”
N0 BWNP, BB RCBRIT,T),;



¢

4. 79:3¢ B F00T STWI_RBB.- 20RO eIRNONNT 793¢ JTTLTE) -

(i) BRI DORTONE) , “2,0T) WRRWRTN" 0 BWNY WTBEIDN “eNRT)
VRENFPTONR" 02 WBRNF,, SRR RIT,T), aNIY, “ZIVIION" DO BT
RRTD) “20T) OF CRFTIONINFTBNS" D020 BWNF), ADAITE,.

(i) BB0IHTIC),-

() () DOBTE). “2NRT SONPNOI" O BWNY TN “e33) 3oNPN03"
N0 BBINFI, aNI), "B0BISRTY” D0 BWNY WWN "303), AedT” 0
BERNF I, ITeNwN @3O3 RAIT,R,,;

(2)) () DOBWRTA). “e33) 3ONPLN03" D0 BWNY WTBEIN "0 WRE3,03"
D02 BWNFI, 3NIY, “80T3) SRT” D0 BWNE WBIN "B A0edT “ dOW
BWNF[), 980FeDeN &)3ABRCB AT, 03I,

() () DOBBA), "20WIJ), ONPN0OI" D0 BINY TN BRAIOED
30NPN03" D0 VWNF, &N, “20TD Aee)T” D0 BBNY WBN Q3,3
203" 02 BBNF), 9T N &3 3O3C3RIT,T),.

5. 80R3¢ B30T SWIBR.- 2R e9PAODNTNT 803¢ &ByFT LT -

(i) "200T3) BRRTITNR” 02 BWNY WWIDN “2NRT) eSRENFPSTNR” 0
BERNFI, B3RV RCRRIT,E), NI, “"ZIONOT" D0 RBEWE WRTEN “20T)
OF BGRTIOINFRTNS" D0 WRNFP, ALDRITE,.

(i) BB0ITIC) -

() (D) DOBTIE). “2,0T3d ONPNOI" D0 JWNRY WWeIN “e33) 3oNYN03”
N0 BVWNPI, 203D, "DV SRTY" D0W BWNE WBRN "@3), A0edT” O
BENFID, ITeNwN &B)303RCRA 3T,

) () DOWRAD. "ZNRTY 30NPN0I" N0W [BNY  WWEPN  "2,0TD
WREF,03" D0W BWNFD, 203, "TCRI SRT" D0W BWNEY BN "BRZTD
A0e)T " D0 BWNP I, €930TeDN 333 BRIT,T),; eI,

() () DOBRBA). “e33) IONFLINPNOI" D0W J/BRNY TN BRAIOED
3ONPN03" DO0W V/BNYTY, NI, 8083 SRTY" D0W JWNY WWN QT3
A0e)T" 02 BBNF), 9Te0N &33O33 RIT,T),.

6. 87:3¢ B30T 3WIBR.- 20RO IPICNNT 873 TJyTTLE), -

(®) "ONTON JOFALIWT" D0 BVWNEY IR0 "9Fe 90T
BRBVIEIDVIWITWT, STWBT 9T IR, LHADATT”  Q0W  BWNPS,
AORIT,R,; NI,



R.N.I. No. KARBIL/2001/47147 POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19
Licensed to post without prepayment WPP No. 297

00

() "2NPRTY 3ONFI[TN” D0V RWNY TN “e33) ONFRITR” 0
BEAYID, TONR "ZNRTY SR D0W IBNY WKBERN "B3), AdT” 0
BRNF), B3B3 RCLAIT,),.

7. 1143¢ RF0ETW STWHIBR.- DR IRIONNT  1143¢ BTTLTE),
"HISONR" D02 WEE WRTIN QB3 4T3 ARITNDT FLHONE) L3 33T 2,0T)
OFT CRTIONNFITN )R DRWIBIWOE" 0 BRNPI), ADRIT,),.

8. 1280d WyTTOTW RCTVF T3, - a0 LINIONENTI 1283 TFyTTEITS 3T O
82 B0DITTI, ADRIT,,, DOTT:-

"1280. FOY) ORVTIFPNY) F0_0D ToNe 230e3¢3) Bo30oNTIZHT..-

(1) 8736 HTTRS), DBRTIDIBRA 9000 VIS RIS e,

WOIFNY) 2N, 90 VIS 90, 108, 113, 114 Hone 123K &BTTNY

980D S INSDR (S eninat>s 5023 _0H0oN33T,3), D3,

2203033030 N3 3T,

2) 873 RTOHE  OROHAS  ORTIGN  ROBLAD D3I,

230 0D NT 3T,

9. 176:3¢ RFVATW 3TWIRBV, - 30 R LIRODNNT 176:3¢ &WyFTLTE)., “e03I),
€903 2F03ONET 383 IoNa3doRIE W5 NP BEITEN,Z)TT,” 0W BWNY,
2ENTBITTN,.

The above translation of the Karnataka Police (Amendment) Act, 2021
(Karnataka Act 28 of 2021) shall be authoritative text in Kannada language
under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26
of 1963).

PR WIFOT® B fE3¢
TOOEEIT D500 T

TREEIT Do2s5000OT e3TTOSIAOT
RID), 9530 BIDIE),,

2.9 ex30°
ABOETT TOONEWDE,
FORDCOD 353300 NH 03I,
RS TS 9083,

BZBD FTorie FZBBT:- FoBUNRZOTW, BIFES D@3, BZFO Be0B) DT Fmovad, onwed

SUNIL GARDE O Roas s o3



		2021-10-05T17:41:24+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




