
(1) 

 

 
  

 

 

Ļ¯ೇಷ ªಾಜÍ ಪĦÎ�ೆ 
 

 

 
DEPARTMENT OF PARLIAMENTARY AFFAIRS AND LEGISLATION SECRETARIAT 

NOTIFICATION 

NO: DPAL 38 SHASANA 2021, BENGALURU, DATED:05.10.2021 

The Karnataka Police (Amendment) Bill, 2021 ಇದಃౙ  2021ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 
4ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಒඪ౭ ಡ අฉൟൿ౪ , ನ  ൟำವัಃಛಜ ಇದඝ౬  
2021ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ : 28  ಎಂ්ർಜ ൽකಂಕ: 05.10.2021ಕකბಟಕ 
ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ ฃಜ ಪൟ ಃ  (ූಗ IVA) ಯย   ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං. 

 
KARNATAKA ACT NO.28 OF 2021 

 

(First Published in the Karnataka Gazette Extra-ordinary on the 5th Day of 
October 2021) 

 

THE KARNATAKA POLICE (AMENDMENT) ACT, 2021 
 (Received the assent of the Governor on the 4th day of October, 2021) 

 

An Act  further to amend the Karnataka Police Act, 1963. 

Whereas it is expedient further to amend the Karnataka Police Act, 1963 

(Karnataka Act 4 of 1964), for the purpose hereinafter appearing: 

Be it enacted by the Karnataka State Legislature in the Seventy second year 

of the Republic of India as follows:- 

1. Short title and commencement.-(1) This Act may be called the 

Karnataka Police (Amendment) Act, 2021. 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2. Amendment of Section 2.-In section 2 of the Karnataka Police Act, 1963 

(Karnataka Act 04 of 1964) (here in after referred to as the Principal Act) in clause 

(3),- 

   ¨sÁUÀ  – 4  

      Part – IVA 

 , 05 , 2021( , 13, , ೧೯೪3) 

BENGALURU, TUESDAY, 05, OCTOBER, 2021(ASHWAYUJA, 13, SHAKAVARSHA, 1943) 

. 814 

No.    814 



2 

(a)  after the words “Profit or gain” occurring in two places the words “or 

otherwise” shall be inserted. 

(b) in clause (7),  

(i) for the words "gaming" does not include a lottery but includes all 

forms of wagering or betting in connection with any game of chance 

except wagering or betting on a horse-race run on any race course 

within or outside the State, when such wagering or betting takes 

place" the words "gaming means and includes online games,  
involving all forms of wagering or betting, including in the form of 

tokens valued in terms of money paid before or after issue of it, or 

electronic means and virtual currency, electronic transfer of funds 

in connection with any game of chance, but does not include a 

lottery or wagering or betting on horse-race run on any race course 

within or outside the State, when such wagering or betting takes 

place” shall be substituted. 

 (ii) in the explanation in item (i) the following shall be inserted at the 

end, namely:- 

"any act or risking money, or otherwise on the unknown result of an 

event including on a game of skill and any action specified above 

carried out directly or indirectly by the players playing any game or 

by any third parties". 

(c)  for clause (11) the following shall be substituted, namely:- 

"(11) 'Instruments of gaming' includes any article used or intended to be 

used as a subject or means of gaming, including computers, computer 

system, mobile app or internet or cyber space, virtual platform, computer 

network, computer resource, any communication device, electronic 

applications, software and accessory or means of online gaming, any 

document, register or record or evidence of any gaming in electronic or 

digital  form, the proceeds of any online gaming as or any winning or prizes  
in money or otherwise distributed or intended to be distrubted inrespect 

of any gaming;  

Explanation: The words ‘computer’, ‘communication device’, ‘computer 
network’, ‘computer resource’, ‘computer system’, ‘cyber café’ and ‘electronic 
record’ used in this Act shall have the respective meaning assigned to them 
in the Information Technology Act, 2000 (Central Act 21 of 2000)". 

(d) after clause (12) the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(12A) “Online gaming” means and includes games as defined in 

clause (7) played online by means of instruments of gaming, 

computer, computer resource, computer net work, computer system  



 3 

or by mobile app or internet or any communication device, electronic 

application, software or on any virtual platform;" 

(e) In clause (13), the following shall be inserted at the end, namely:- 

"including a recreation club or on virtual platform, mobile app or 

internet  or any communication device, electronic application, 

software, online gaming and computer resource as defined in 

Information Technology Act, 2000(Central Act 21 of 2000) or under 

this Act;" 

3. Amendment of Section 78.-In section 78 of the Principal Act, In sub-

section (1) in clause (a),-  

(a) after the words "enclosure, vehicle, vessel or place" the words  and 

figures "or at cyber café or online gaming involving wagering or betting 

including computer resource or mobile application or internet or any 

communication device as defined in the Information Technology Act, 

2000 (Central Act 21 of 2000)" shall be inserted. 

(i) in clause (vi) after the words "depend on chance or" the words "skill of 

other" shall be inserted. 
(ii) after the clause (vi) the following shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(vii)on any act on risking money or otherwise on the 

unknown result of an event including on a game of skill"; 
or 

(iii) in the hanging para for the words "one year" the words "three years" 
and for the words "one thousand" the words "one lakh" shall be 

substituted. 
(iv) in the proviso for the words “one month” the words “six months” and 

for the words “five hundred” the words “ten thousand” shall 
respectively be substituted; 

(b) In sub-section (2),- 

(i) after the words "sub section or present" the words   "or aids or abets" 

shall be inserted; 

(ii)  for the words "one month" the words "six months" and for the words 
"five hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be respectively 

substituted; 

(c) In sub-section (3), for the words "three months" the words "one year" and 

for the words "three hundred" the words "twenty thousand" shall be 

respectively substituted. 

4. Amendment of Section 79.- In section 79 of the Principal Act,- 

(i) in the hanging para, for the words "one year" the words "three years" shall 

be substituted and after the word "fine"  the words "up to rupees one lakh" shall be 
inserted;  



4 

(ii) in the proviso,- 

(a)  in clause (a) for the words "three months" the words "six months" 

and for the words "five hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be 

respectively substituted;  

(b) in clause (b) for the words "six months" the words "one year" and for 

the words "five hundred" the words "fifteen thousand" shall be 

respectively substituted; and 

(c) in clause (c) for the words "nine months" the words "eighteen 
months" and for the words "one thousand" the words "twenty 

thousand" shall be respectively substituted. 

5. Amendment of Section 80.-In section 80 of the Principal Act,-  

(i)  for the words "one year" the words "three years" shall be substituted and 

after the word "fine" the words "upto rupees one lakh" shall be inserted; 

(ii) in the proviso,- 

(a)  in clause (a) for the words "one month" the words "six months" and 
for the words "two hundred" the words "ten thousand" shall be 

respectively substituted;  

(b) in clause (b) for the words "three months" the words "one year" and 

for the words "two hundred" the words "fifteen thousand" shall be 

respectively substituted; and 

(c) in clause (c) for the words "six months" the words "eighteen months" 

and for the words "five hundred" the words "twenty thousand" shall 
be respectively substituted. 

6. Amendment of Section 87.-In section 87 of the Principal Act,- 

(a) after the words "suspected to be gaming" the words "or aiding or 

abetting such gaming" shall be inserted; 

(b) for the words "three months" the words "six  months" and for the words 

"three hundred" the words "Ten thousand" shall be respectively 

substituted. 

7. Amendment of Section 114.- In section 114 of  the Principal Act, after 

the words “fine” the words “which shall not be less than twenty five thousand but 

which may extend to rupees one lakh” shall be inserted.  

8. Insertion of section 128A.-After section 128 the Principal Act the  

following shall be inserted, namely:- 

“128A.Certain offences to be Cognizable, Non-bailable,- 

(1) All offences under chapter VII except section 87; and all offences 
under section 90, 108, 113, 114 and 123 under chapter VIII shall be 
cognizable and non-bailable; 

(2) Offences under section 87 shall be cognizable and bailable .” 
 



 5 

9. Amendment of section 176.-In section 176 of the Principal Act, the words “and 

to wagering by persons taking part in such game of skill” shall be omitted. 

 
By Order and in the name of 
the Governor of Karnataka, 

 
 

G.SRIDHAR 
Secretary to Government 

Department of Parliamentary 
Affairs and Legislation 

 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  ๎ಸನ ರಚච ಸ฿ಲಯ 
ಅඌಚච 

ಒ : ವ ๎ಇ 38 ๎ಸನ 2021, ಂಗิฆ, ൽකಂಕ: 05.10.2021. 
The Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 of 1963) ರ 

ಪ ಕರಣ 5-ಎ ರ ಅലಯย  ฃಜ ඩಲคಂದ ಅඌಂತತัದ The Karnataka Police 

(Amendment) Act, 2021 (Karnataka Act No 28   of 2021) ರ ූಂತರವඝ౬  ಅඌಂತ 

ಕನ౬ ಡ ಪಠ ๅಂൿ   ൽකಂಕ: 05.10.2021 ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ ฃಜ ಪൟ ಃ (ූಗ-

IVA) ಯย  ಪ ಕഔಸಃಂൿ ಆඃ๏ಸมಜං. 

2021 ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ ಒ :  28   
(2021 ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 5ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ಪತ ದ เ๕ಷ 

ಃಯย  ෮ದฤ ಪ ಕಟ฿ಜං)  
 

ಕකბಟಕ ยೕ (ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 

(2021 ರ ಅಆౣ ೕಬฑ ൟಂಗಳ 4ඡ ൽකಂಕඈൿ ฃಜ  ඩಲคಂದ ಒඪ౭ ಡಯඝ౬  

ಪഷಯมಜං) 

 ಕකბಟಕ ยೕ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 1963ඝ౬  ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ಡฤ ಒಂൿ 

ಅඌඛಯಮ. 

 ಇย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ಉഴ ಬฆವ ಉං౪ ೕಶಗัಛಜ ಕකბಟಕ ยೕ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 

1963ඝ౬  (1964ರ ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 4) ಮತ౨ ౣ  ൟൿ౪ ಪല ഴโൿ 

ಕ౨ ฿ಜฆโದคಂದ;   

 ಇൿ, ූರತ ಗಣฃಜ ದ ಎಪ౭ ౨ ರಡඡ ವಷბದย  ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ  เඋನ 

ಡಲದൽಂದ  ಈ ෨ಂൽඦ ಅඌඛಯ෦ತ฿ಗย;- 

1. ౾౹ ಪ౨  ກಸฆ ಮൡ౨  ඩ ฏಭ.- (1) ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮವඝ౬  ಕකბಟಕ ยೕ 

(ൟൿ౪ ಪല) ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2021 ಎಂൿ ಕฉಯತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 



6 

 (2) ಇൿ, ಈ ಁಡศ ೦คಡ ಬರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 2. 2ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.-  ಕකბಟಕ ยೕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 1963ರ            (1964ರ 

ಕකბಟಕ ಅඌඛಯಮ 04)  (ಇದರย  ಇඝ౬ ෨ಂං ෩ಲ  ಅඌඛಯಮๅಂൿ 

ಉว ೕಸมಜං)  2ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (3)ඡ ಘಡದย  ,- 

 (ಎ) ಎರഴ ಕഷಗಳย  ಬฆವ “มಭ ಅಥ฿ ඩದච” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ 

“ಅಥ฿ ಅನ ൭” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 () 7ඡ ಘಡದย ,- 

 (i) “೪೦ಟ” มಟคಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ โൽಲ  ಆದฉ ฃಜ ದ ಒಳಡ ಅಥ฿ ຄರಡ 

෴โඃ ช ಆೕბನย  ಀൿฉ ಓಟದ ඵದ ದ ෬ว ೧ ಕഖౣ เಃ  ಅಥ฿ 

ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃಯඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല, ಅಂಥ  ೧ ಕഖౣ เಃ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃ 

ನഷ฿ಜನ ೪೦ಟದ ෴โඃ ඵದ ದ ීಧದย ನ  ಎಲ  คೕൟಯ 

೧ಕഖౣ เಃ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ โൿ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ 

“೪೦ಟ” ಎಂದฉ ಆඨษඨ ಆಟಗำ ಟ ജೕಕඝ౬ ಗಳ งಪದย ൿ౪ , ಇದඝ౬  ඛೕലದ 

෮ದฤ ಅಥ฿ ತฆ฿ಯ ಹಣ ඩವൟವ ඛීಧචಗಳย  ಲ  ຄಂൽฆโದඝ౬   

ಒಳತಂഴ เൿ ක ನ เಧಗำ ಮൡ౨  ವೋბವฯ ಕฉඛ౺ , ඛඌಗಳ เൿ ක ನ ವಛბವൕ, 

ಎม  คೕൟಯ ೧ ಕഖౣ เಃ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ โൿ, ಆದฉ 

มಟคಯඝ౬  ಅಥ฿ ฃಜ ದ ಒಳಡ ಅಥ฿ ຄರಡ ช ಆೕბನย  ಀൿฉ ಓಟದ 

ඵದ ದ ෬ว ಅಂಥ ೧ಕഖౣ เಃ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃ ನഷ฿ಜನ 

ඵದ ಕഖౣ เಃ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣಕഖౣ เಃಯඝ౬  ಒಳತำ โൽಲ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(ii) เವರൕಯ ් (i) ರย  “ಅಥ฿ ງಃ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ 

෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

“෴โඃ ಹಣඛ ಭವ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ౽ಯბ ಅಥ฿ ಅನ ൭ ಈಶಲ ದ 

ඵದ ವඣ౬ ಳತಂಡ ಫย൞ಂಶ ತൟ౨ ಲ ದ ಪ ಗ ಟ ෴โඃ ඵದ ವක౬ ഴವ 

ಆಟಛರฆ ಅಥ฿ ෴ช ෩ರඡ ಪౘ౽ರฆ ಪ  ೕಕ฿ಜ ಅಥ฿ ಪฌೕౘ฿ಜ 

ಅತำ ವ, ෬ว ඛൽბಷౣ ಪലದ ෴โඃ ౽ಯბ”  ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

() (11)ඡ ಘಡಃౙ  ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 



 7 

“(11) ’೪೦ഴเಃಯ ಉಪಕರಣಗำ’ ಎಂಬ ಪದโ ಗಣಕ ತ ಗำ, ಗಣಕ ತ  

೯ೕಡൕ(ಸౣ ಂ), ෮ාฯ ಆභ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂತ೦ბಲ ಅಥ฿ ಬฑ ൞ಣ, ವೋბವฯ 

ๆൽಃ, ಗಣಕ ತ  ೦ಲ, ಗಣಕತ  ಪඞ ಲ, ෴โඃ ವಹನ ಧನ, 

เൿ ක ನ ಅನ౷ ಕಗำ, ൪൞ ಂಶಗಳඣ౬ ಳತಂഽ ೪೦ഴเಃಯ ವ౨ ฿ಜ 

ಅಥ฿ ಧನಗะಜ ಬಳದ ಅಥ฿ ಬಳಸฤ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ದ ෴โඃ ವ౨  ಮൡ౨  

෴โඃ ೪೦ഴเಃಯ ಉಪಧನಗำ ಅಥ฿ ಧನಗำ, เൿ ක ನ ಅಥ฿ 

ല೧ಟฯ งಪದย ฆವ ෴โඃ ೪೦ഴเಃಯ ෴โඃ ದ౨ ๆ೩, ค೧ಸౣ ฑ 

ಅಥ฿ ಅศಖ ಅಥ฿ ౘ  ಅಥ฿ ງಚฤ ಉං౪ ೕ๏ಸมದ ෴โඃ มಭಗำ 

ಅಥ฿ ಹಣದ งಪದ ಅಥ฿ ಹಣ ಅಥ฿ ฉ งಪದย ฆವ ಬನಗಳඝ౬  

ಒಳತำ ತ౨ ං.  

 เವರൕ:- ಈ ಅඌඛಯಮದย  ಬಳಸมದ “ಗಣಕತ ” ‘ವಹನ ಧನ’ 

ಗಣಕತ  ೦ಲ, ‘ಗಣಕತ  ಪඞ ಲ’, ಗಣಕತ  ೯ೕಡൕ(ಸౣ ಂ),’ ‘ ಬฑ ಃ’ 

ಮൡ౨  ‘เൿ ක ನ ർಖว’ ಈ  ಪದಗำ, ൟ  ൪ತ ೦ౢ ನ  ಅඌඛಯಮ,      2000ರย  

(2000ರ ಄ಂದ  ಅඌඛಯಮ 21) ಅโಗัಡ  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ඛೕಡมದ ಅಥბವච౬ ೕ 

ຄಂൽರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .” 

(ല)  (12)ඡ ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(12ಎ) “ಆඨ ษඨ ೪೦ഴเಃ” ಎಂದฉ (7)ඡ ಘಡದย  ಪคූඈ, 

೪೦ഴเಃಯ ಉಪಕರಣಗಳ ಧನಗಳ ෩ಲಕ ಆඨษඨನย  ಆഴವ ඵದ ಗำ 

ಮൡ౨  ಇൿ ಗಣಕತ , ಗಣಕತ  ಪඞ ಲ, ಗಣಕತ  ౽ಯბ೦ಲ, ಗಣಕತ  

೯ೕಡൕ (ಸౣ ಂ) ಅಥ฿ ෮ාฯ ಆභ ෩ಲಕ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂತ೦ბಲ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ 

ವಹನ ಧನ, เൿ ක ನ ಅನ౷ ಃ, ൪൞ ಂಶದ ෩ಲಕ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ 

ವೋბವฯ ๆൽಃಯย  ಆഴವ ඵದ ಗಳඝ౬  ಒಳತำ ತ౨ ං. 

 (ಇ) (13)ඡ ಘಡದ “ಎಂ්ದರย ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  

คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:-   

 “ൟ ൪ತ ೦ౢ ನ ಅඌඛಯಮ, 2000ರย  (2000ರ ಄ಂದ  ಅඌඛಯಮ 21)  

ಪคූඈ  ಮನฏಜක ಕ  ಅಥ฿ ವೋბವฯ ๆൽಃಯย , ෮ාฯ ಆභ 

ಅಥ฿ ಅಂತ೦ბಲ ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ವಹನ ಧನ, เൿ ක ನ ಅನ౷ ಃ, ൪൞ ಂಶ, 

ಆඨษඨ ೪೦ഴเಃ ಮൡ౨  ಗಣಕತ  ಪඞ ಲವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂഽ ” 



8 

 3. 78ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല;-  ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 78ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ (1)ඡ 

ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย ನ (ಎ) ಘಡದย ,- 

 (ಎ) “ ಆವರಣ, ฿ಹನ, ඥಃ ಅಥ฿ ಸ౩ ಳದ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ 

ൟ ൪ತ ೦ౢ ನ ಅඌඛಯಮ,2000ರย  (2000ರ ಄ಂದ  ಅඌඛಯಮ 21)  

ಪคූඈ ಗಣಕತ  ಪඞ ಲ ಅಥ฿ ෮ාฯ ಅನ౷ ಃ ಅಥ฿ ಅಂತ೦ბಲ 

ಅಥ฿ ෴โඃ ವಹನ ಧನವඝ౬  ಒಳತಂಡ ಬฑ ൞ಣ ಅಥ฿ ඵದ  

ಕഖౣ โൿ ಅಥ฿ ಪಣ ಕഖౣ โದඝ౬  ಒಳತಂലฆವ ಆඨษඨ ೪೦ഴเಃ”  ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  ಅಂ౾ಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(i)  (vi)ඡ ಘಡದย  “ಅඁಷౣ ವඝ౬ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ ಮ൧౨ ಬ౯ ರ 

ಈಶಲ ವඝ౬ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದವඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

(ii)    (vi)ඡ ಘಡದ ತฆ฿ಯ ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:- 

 “(vii) ಹಣඛ ಭವದ ෴โඃ ౽ಯბ ಅಥ฿ ಅನ ൭ ಈಶಲ  ඵದ ವඝ౬  

ಒಳತಂಡ ಫย൞ಂಶ ತൟ౨ ಲ ದ ಪ ಗದ ෬ว; ಅಥ฿”  

 (iii) ಇದರ ೯ೕലತ ಘലಃಯย  “ಒಂൿ ವฆಷದವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ 

“෩ฆ ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಟ “ಒಂൿ เರ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ 

“ಒಂൿ ಲౘ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (iv) ಪฏൡಕದย  “ಒಂൿ ൟಂಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆฆ ൟಂಗัಡ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಐൿ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൡ౨  เರ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 ()  (2)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (i) “ಅย  ಜคದ౪ ฉ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ චರโ ඛೕലದฉ ಅಥ฿  

ൿද౭ იೕชඪದฉ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 (ii)  “ಒಂൿ ൟಂಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆฆ ൟಂಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಐൿඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൡ౨  เರ“ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () (3)ඡ ಉಪಪ ಕರಣದย  “෩ฆ ൟಂಗำಗಳವರಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ 

“ಒಂൿ ವಷბದವฉಡ” ಮൡ౨  “෩ฆ ඞฆ“ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  เರ” 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 



 9 

 4. 79ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 79ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (i) ೯ೕലತ ಘലಃಯย , “ಒಂൿ ವฆಷದವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “෩ฆ 

ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “೩ม ච” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ 

෮ದฤ “ಒಂൿ ಲౘ งඩಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಪฏൡಕದย ,- 

 (ಎ) (ಎ) ಘಡದย  “෩ฆ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆฆ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಐൿඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൡ౨  เರ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () () ಘಡದย  “ಆฆ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಒಂൿ ವಷბ౾ౙ ಂತ” 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಐൿ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൽජൿ เರ “ ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

  ()  () ಘಡದย  “ಒಂಬൡ౨  ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ“ ಹൽචಂഖ 

ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಒಂൿ เರ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  

เರ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 5. 80ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 80ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (i)  “ಒಂൿ ವฆಷದವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “෩ฆ ವಷბಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  “೩ม චಂದ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ෮ದฤ “ಒಂൿ 

ಲౘ งඩಗಳವฉಜನ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 (ii) ಪฏൡಕದย ,- 

 (ಎ) (ಎ) ಘಡದย  “ಒಂൿ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆฆ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” 

ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൡ౨  เರ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

 () () ಘಡದย  “෩ฆ ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಒಂൿ 

ವಷბ౾ౙ ಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಎರഴ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൽජൿ 

เರ “ ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; ಮൡ౨  

  ()  () ಘಡದย  “ಆฆ ൟಂಗำಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ“ ಹൽචಂഖ 

ൟಂಗัಜಂತ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಮൡ౨  “ಐൿ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಇಪ౭ ൡ౨  

เರ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಅඝಕ ಮ฿ಜ ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 6. 87ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 87ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย ,- 

 (ಎ) “ಕ౨ ฿ಜ ๚౾ಸมದฉ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ತฆ฿ಯ “ಅಥ฿ ಅಂಥ 

೪೦ಟ฿ഴโದಃౙ  චರ฿ದฉ ಅಥ฿ ൿ౭ იೕชඪದฉ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ ;  ಮൡ౨   



10 

 () “෩ฆ ൟಂಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಆฆ ൟಂಗಳವฉಡ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಟ “෩ฆ ඞฆ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳ ಬದมಜ “ಹൡ౨  เರ” ಎಂಬ 

ಪದಗಳඝ౬  ಪ ൟೕ೧ಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

  

 7. 114ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല.- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 114ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย   

“೩ม චಟ” ಎಂಬ ಪದದ ෮ದฤ “ಇಪ౭ ౨ ೖൿ เರಗัಡ ಕല෫ಯಲ ದ ಆದฉ ಒಂൿ 

ಲౘ งඩಗಳವฉಡ เಸ౨ คಸಬർದ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 

 8. 128ಎ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಪბഷ,- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 128ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ತฆ฿ಯ 

ಈ ෨ಂൽನದඝ౬  คಸತಕౙ ൿ౪ , ಎಂದฉ:-  

 “128ಎ. ಃಲโ ಅಪฃಧಗำ ೬ౢ ಯ ಟ ೦෦ೕඝ ರತ฿ಜฆโൿ.-  

(1) 87ඡ ಪ ಕರಣವඝ౬  ຄರൡಪല ಅඋ ಯ VIIರ  ಅലಯย ನ ಎม  

ಅಪฃಧಗำ  ಮൡ౨  ಅඋ ಯ VIIIರ 90, 108, 113, 114 ಟ 123ඡ ಪ ಕರಣಗಳ 

ಅലಯย ನ ಎม  ಅಪฃಧಗำ ೬ౢ ೕಯ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪  ಮൡ౨  

೦෦ೕඝರತ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ ; 

(2) 87ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ಅലಯย ನ ಅಪฃಧಗำ ೬ౢ ೕಯ ಮൡ౨  

೦෦ೕඛಯ฿ಜರತಕౙ ൿ౪ .  

 9. 176ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದ ൟൿ౪ ಪല,- ෩ಲ ಅඌඛಯಮದ 176ඡ ಪ ಕರಣದย , “ಮൡ౨  

ಅಂಥ ೈൡಯბದ ಆಟದย  ූಗವವ ವ ౾౨ ಗำ ಪಣಕഖౣ โದಃౙ ” ಎಂಬ ಪದಗಳඝ౬  

ഖౣ ಡತಕౙ ൿ౪ . 
 

The above translation of the Karnataka Police (Amendment) Act, 2021 

(Karnataka Act  28  of 2021) shall be authoritative text  in Kannada language 

under section 5-A of the Karnataka Official Language Act, 1963 (Karnataka Act 26 

of 1963).  

൭ವฑඊ ಡຄ ೕഡ 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ඩಲฆ 

 
ಕකბಟಕ ฃಜ ඩಲರ ಆඃ๎ඝರ 

ಮൡ౨  ಅವರ ກಸคನย , 
 

೧.๏ ೕಧฑ 
ಸ౽ბರದ ౽ಯბದ๏ბ, 

ಸൽೕಯ ವ ವರಗำ ಮൡ౨  
๎ಸನ ರಚච ಇมಒ. 

 
 

ಮುದÎಕರು ²ಾಗೂ ಪÎ�ಾಶಕರು:- ಸಂಕಲ£ಾĩ�ಾĸಗಳ�, ಕ£ಾ�ಟಕ ªಾಜÍಪತÎ, ಸ�ಾ�ĸ �ೇಂದÎ ಮುದÎ�ಾಲಯ, ¦ೆಂಗಳ�ರು 

R.N.I.  No. KARBIL/2001/47147  POSTAL REGN. No. RNP/KA/BGS/2202/2017-19 

Licensed to post without prepayment   WPP No. 297 


		2021-10-05T17:41:24+0530
	SUNIL GARDE




